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Written by Robert ID3085
Monday, 23 October 2006 22:08 - 

ProHipHop (prohiphop.com), the first hip hop industry weblog and a leading music industry
website, is holding a Hip Hop Domain Auction on Ebay opening Wednesday, October 25th at
Noon (EST) and closing Saturday, November 4th at Noon (EST). The hip hop domains on offer
are solid values for immediate or future use at a time when great domains are already few and
far between.

  

Regarding the auction, ProHipHop owner/blogger Clyde Smith states, "Some of those domains
are pretty sweet but it's time to let them go. Think of it as a gesture of goodwill from someone
who could use a little cash for business development and dig deep as we enter the holiday
season!"

  

Asked if he would miss such domains as DefBusiness.com, Clyde noted, "I did want to save
that one for my biography of Russell Simmons. But somehow I have a feeling that's a book I
won''t write."

  

The domains to be auctioned:

  

DefBusiness.com

  

HipHopResearch.com/net/org

  

RapBarrio.com

BarrioRap.com

  

HipHopRhythm.com
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HipHopRhythms.com

  

WeeklyHipHop.com

  

VidHipHop.com

  

The auction will occur at Ebay and the listing can be found via the ProHipHop Ebay profile or by
searching for Hip Hop Domains:

http://myworld.ebay.com/prohiphop

  

The domains will not be viewable as auction items until Noon, October 25th.

  

Additional information can be found at ProHipHop:

http://www.prohiphop.com/domains

  

Proceeds of the auction will support new projects at ProHipHop.

  

About ProHipHop:

  

ProHipHop (prohiphop.com) is a Hip Hop Marketing and Business News weblog authored by
Clyde Smith. ProHipHop focuses on hip hop marketing and advertising with related business
news and analysis. Launched in San Francisco in 2004, ProHipHop was the first hip hop
industry blog and is a leading music industry website.
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ProHipHop is at the center of a growing network of hip hop industry resources including the
recently launched Weekly Hip Hop Albums (weeklyhiphopalbums.com), a blog and newsletter
delivered each Monday with Tuesday's new hip hop album releases. Each week's report also
features a wide range of album cover art. Weekly Hip Hop Albums is the web's most accurate
and up to date source of new hip hop album releases.

  

Hip Hop Press (hiphoppress.com) is a companion site to ProHipHop that provides daily hip hop
press releases via blog or newsletter.  Hip Hop Press is now the leading outlet for hip hop and
related music industry press releases.

  

ProHipHop, Weekly Hip Hop Albums and Hip Hop Press are media properties of Altered Beta
(alteredbeta.com).

  

ProHipHop

http://www.prohiphop.com

  

Weekly Hip Hop Albums

http://www.weeklyhiphopalbums.com

  

Hip Hop Press

http://www.hiphoppress.com

  

Altered Beta
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http://www.alteredbeta.com

  

Contact:

ProHipHop

Clyde Smith

clyde(at)prohiphop(dot)com

919-424-1208
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